






Drapery Sheer Shades takes elegant and soft sheer to create 
an elegant and graceful effect. It is an ideal replacement for tra-
ditional curtains. Just open the Shades gently to enjoy the pic-
turesque scenery outside

A variety of patterns and colors, fully enrich your imagination.

It provide the delicate appearance, excellent straightness of 
fabrics and can protect the privacy.

A perfect combination of sheer and fabric, not only provide the 
shading effect of fabric, but also has the perspective of sheer, 
It also integrates the adjusting function of the venetian blinds, 
simple operation while luxurious appearance, solves complex 
problems in a simple way.



Patented operating system that rotated to open and close, pro-
viding a high privacy for home and softening the lights into the 
room; The fabric can be completely hang naturally  without ad-
ditional weight increment device

Colors of fabrics can be mixed to meet different personalized 
needs;

Unique design of blades, gently turning the blades can adjust 
the light into the room and the need of privacy.

Sheer valance design has excellent sound-absorbing perfor-
mance, which can improve reverberation in different environ-
ments.

Easy to maintain and clean, the blades can be removed sepa-
rately, just need to clean stained blades, convenient and time- 
saveing; If there is a damaged blades in the process of use, 
just replace the damaged part, so you can free from worry and 
save effort to have a delicate life.
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FABRIC COLLECTION INDEX

FABRIC NAME

Mario-5%                                        24% Polyester 76% PVC                           5%

Mario-1%                                        24% Polyester 76% PVC                           1%

RSD1-1%                                         22% Polyester 78% PVC                           1%

RSD3-3%                                         22% Polyester 78% PVC                           3%

Nova Twill 3% - NTO3                   25% Polyester 75% PVC                           3%

Solar Block - 0%                            25% Polyester 75% PVC                           0%

Solar Blockout  - 0%                     25% Polyester 75% PVC  　　　　　　　0%

NightFall - 0%                                24% Polyester 76% PVC  　　　　　　　0%

Clear Vision                                    22% Polyester 78% PVC  　　　1% / 3% / 5% /10%

Clear Vision - E                              31% Polyester 69% PVC  　　　                  5%

Blockout - Scala                   100% Polyester With Foam Coating               0%

Horizon Basket 3% - HBO3          22% Polyester 78% PVC                           3%

External Basket 3% - EB03          26% Polyester 74% PVC                           3%

External Basket 5% - EB05          26% Polyester 74% PVC                            5%

Horizon Basket 5% - HB05          22% Polyester 78% PVC                           5%

CONTENT OPENNESS FACTOR







 
 
 
 

  

WHITE / WHITE                            WHITE / LINEN                             WHITE / PEARL

WHITE / GREY                               WHITE / SAND                            WHITE / BLACK

1%
OPENNESS

5%
OPENNESS

Mario 1%  -  5% Openness



3%
OPENNESS

5%
OPENNESS

Horizon Basket 3%  -  5% Openness

WHITE / WHITE                           WHITE / LINEN                              WHITE / PEARL

WHITE / BLACK                           WHITE / GREY                                WHITE / SAND

WHITE / BLACK                            WHITE / GREY                               WHITE / SAND



External Basket 3%  -  5% Openness

3%
OPENNESS

5%
OPENNESS

WHITE / WHITE                             WHITE / LINEN                             WHITE/ PEARL

WHITE / GREY                               WHITE / SAND                              BL ACK/ PEARL

BLACK / BLACK                            BLACK / GREY                              BLACK / BROWN



0%
OPENNESS

Solar Block 0%      Openness

BLACK/BLACK                                  BLACK/GREY                             BLACK/BROWN

GREY/GREY                                 GREY/DARK GREY



3%
OPENNESS

Nova Twill 3%  Openness

WHITE / WHITE                             WHITE / LINEN                             WHITE/ PEARL

WHITE / BLACK                              WHITE / GREY                              WHITE / SAND

BLACK/PEARL                                BLACK/BLACK                             BLACK/BROWN



1%
OPENNESS

RSD 1%   -   3%    Openness

Pearl                           White/Black                            Grey                                 Sand

3%
OPENNESS



Blockout - Scala 0%    Openness

        Grey                        Grey/Dark Grey                   Black/Grey                  Black/Bronze

Black/Dark Grey                      Black                            Grey/White



0%
OPENNESS

Solar Blockout 0%    Openness

Grey                            White/White                    White/Grey                   Grey/Dark Grey

White/Sand                       Black/Grey                    Black/Bronze               Black/Dark Grey

Black



CV-E 5%
OPENNESS

5%
OPENNESS

1%
OPENNESS

10%
OPENNESS

3%
OPENNESS

Clear Vision 1% / 3% / 5% /10%

CV-0101 White /White             CV-0107 White / Sand            CV-0105 White/Grey               CV-0104 White /Black

CVE-0101 White/White          CVE-0107 White/Sand           CVE-0105 White/Grey            CVE-0104 White/Black



0%
OPENNESS

Night Fall 0%    Openness

        Grey                        Grey/Dark Grey                   Black/Grey                  Black/Bronze

Black/Dark Grey                      Black                            Grey/White




